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Ever since access to ubiquitous re-
al-time data emerged as a techno-
logical reality, businesses have been 
lured by the possibility of redirect-
ing their supply chains toward a 
model driven by demand. Applying 
analytics software to make sense of 
big data could allow organizations 
to close the gap between demand 
and supply.

The implications of such a vision 
are many. It would enable retailers 
to reduce inventories to levels that 
would meet, but not exceed, their 
current requirements. It would al-
low retail suppliers to operate in a 
“sell one, make one” environment. 
In a demand-oriented environ-
ment, products coming off manu-
facturing assembly lines will have 
already been pre-allocated against 
customer orders.

It’s tempting to believe that imple-
menting the right technologies will 
do the trick in the transition to a 
demand orientation. The experts at 
GEP, a provider of procurement and 
supply-chain strategy, software and 
managed services, take exception to 
that notion. Technology, they preach, 
must play a supporting role to the 
transformation of the interconnect-
ed relationships and processes that 
are the true keys to emerging as a 
demand-driven organization.

In a demand-driven world, organi-
zations could accurately forecast 

demand for commodities, supplies 
and spare parts; communicate 
that demand effectively to sup-
pliers; have vendors respond to 
that demand accurately; and po-
sition their optimized inventories 
where they can be most effectively 
put to use. A study undertaken at 
the Cranfield University School of 
Management in the United King-
dom concluded that, “Remodeling 
our supply chains into demand 
chains creates the possibility that 
waste and obsolescence can be 
reduced. Companies in this world 
will not create demand unless they 
can supply it.” 

Needless to say, it is easier said than 
done, especially when supply-chain 
disruptions like the COVID-19 pan-
demic appear out of the blue. Im-
plementing the personnel, process 
and technology changes necessary 
to bring a demand-chain vision to 
fruition is laborious and time-con-
suming. The changes that come 
from transforming an organiza-
tion’s dominant logic from produc-
tion-push to demand-pull do not 
appear overnight. 

But the potential rewards are enor-
mous. These include not only cutting 
costs and waste, but also the possi-
bility of attracting new and better 
kinds of customers: those open to 
forging genuine and productive 
partnerships, leading to higher mar-
gins and profits for the company.

“A lot of this has to do with dia-
log,” says James Fowler, a senior 
manager at GEP. “You need to have 
broad-ranging conversations with 
customers to understand their is-
sues and pain points. It’s about 
making the relationship more 
than just transactional and into a  
true partnership.”

Driscoll's Inc., a California-based 
family-owned global seller of fresh 
berries and a GEP customer, finds 
itself toward the beginning of a 
two-year process to become more 
demand oriented. It’s a critical 
quest for the company, since it sells 
a perishable product that loses val-
ue every day it doesn’t find a home 
with a retail customer. 

At this point, 65% of Driscoll’s 
product is shipped directly to re-
tailers, while 35% is shipped to 
consolidation points and put on 
Driscoll’s stock. “We have to look 
for demand” to sell the remaining 
product on stock, says Alfredo Mo-
lin, the company’s supply-chain 
director for Europe, the Middle 
East and Africa, “and it may be one 
or two days before it is shipped to  
a customer.”

That means some of the fruit will 
likely fetch lower prices than if it 
were shipped directly. Pushing out 
these products also complicates 
Driscoll’s logistics equation, since it 
may have to pay for premium trans-
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portation to deliver the products 
quicker, increasing its costs.

“Our people are used to looking at 
everything organized around sup-
ply,” Molin says. “They always focus 
on the push of volume into the sys-
tem. Sometimes we have to be cre-
ative to get everything out.

“Now, we need to turn that around 
and to engage with customers com-
pletely differently to get more pre-
dictability on the demand side,” he 
adds. “That requires a change in 
people’s behavior.”

Driscoll’s employees may need a 
culture change, but so will some 
of its customers. “In a supply-driv-
en organization, we need to have 
some customers that can act as a 
valve because we need to push vol-
ume out,” Molin says. “They take 
product from us only when we 
have oversupply and can reduce 
the price.” 

In a demand-driven organization, 
Driscoll’s customers will ideally 
take delivery of berries 52 weeks 
a year. But in order to attract those 
kinds of customers, Driscoll’s needs 
to ensure that it has the required 
supply year round. “We need the 
right programs, conversations and 
agreements in place,” Molin says, 
“so that we can work to ensure that 
we can meet their demand on the 
supply side.”

Implementing the correct pro-
cesses to facilitate a demand ori-
entation will include changing the 
focus of planning meetings. “You 
have to have the right people in 
there,” Fowler says. “You need to 
include the key stakeholders like 
supply chain, sales and marketing 
and they need to understand what 
they have to do before coming into 

these planning sessions. It all looks 
very easy on paper, but it involves 
a huge change in cultural behavior 
and process.”

At Driscoll’s, strategic planning 
spans a five year arc, since it takes 
that long for new plants to be nur-
tured to the point that they can 

bear fruit. “That includes making 
sure that nurseries have the right 
varieties,” Molin says, “because 
plants can grow only under certain 
specific conditions.” It also means 
finding the acreage required on a 
yearly basis to produce the desired 
volume of berries.

“When we shift to being more 
demand-driven, more fruit will 
go directly from the field to the  
customer,” Molin says.

The hoped-for tighter relationship 
between supply and demand means 
that in some cases a company may 
find it difficult to satisfy demand. 
“In those cases, you need to have 
clear allocation and prioritization 
rules,” Fowler says. 

Companies also need clear policies 
on whether and when expedited 
transportation services will be en-
gaged to satisfy a customer, a pro-
cess consideration that speaks to 
the balance between quality and 
costs. To take an extreme exam-
ple, Driscoll’s might better ensure 
freshness and quality if it would 
airfreight berries to retailers more 
frequently, but that would drive 
costs through the roof. 

“We are a volume-driven business, 
but we also need to deliver fruit in 
a condition that will be accepted,” 
Molin says. “If a customer rejects a 
shipment, we will get paid almost 
nothing for it — so sometimes we 
need to expedite fruit with dedicat-
ed transport to deliver our custom-
er promise.” 

Another process change to consid-
er when migrating to a demand ori-
entation is the role of outsourcing. 
Fundamental to this consideration 
is an examination of the company’s 
core competencies.

“From there you can determine 
what to retain in house and what 
to outsource,” Fowler says. “There 
are some interesting ways to get to  
that conclusion.”

An analysis of Driscoll's opera-
tions, for example, found that 50% 
of the company’s workforce and 
expenditures are connected to the 
supply chain. Fowler asks: “Is that 
something that Driscoll’s needs to  
be doing?”

“We are a  
volume-driven  
business, but  

we also need to  
deliver fruit in a 

condition that will 
be accepted.  If a 

customer rejects a 
shipment, we will 
get paid almost 
nothing for it.”



The answer to that question should 
be informed, according to Fowler, 
by an analysis of if and how a com-
pany can accomplish a step-change 
to its business model through out-
sourcing. “It has to be more than 
just about savings and efficiency,” 
he says.

The technology offerings of some 
third-party logistics providers, 
such as transportation and ware-
house management systems, could 
facilitate such a step-change. “Every 
company has to ask some funda-
mental questions — including how 
much control it is willing to give 
up,” Fowler says.

Driscoll’s business model concen-
trates value heavily at the polar 
opposites of the agricultural cycle. 
The company invests in research 
and development of berry varieties 
and growing methods, on one hand, 
and in selling and marketing to cus-
tomers, on the other. 

“Everything in between is not 
core to our business,” Molin 
says. That would suggest that 
Driscoll’s could be a candi-
date for outsourcing much of its  
supply-chain operations.

But it’s not quite as simple as that. 
The company has a substantial 
growth ambition for the next five 
years and a reputation for quali-
ty and freshness to maintain. “We 
need to do some heavy lifting our-
selves in order to accomplish these 
goals,” Molin says, “so we are look-
ing for a partner to do that with 
us and to help us move faster in  
our development.” 

“If we did it all ourselves we would 
have to reinvent the wheel,” he 
adds. “It’s better to hook up with a 
partner that has done these things 

many times before, so that our 
learning curve will go much faster.”

The technology piece appears 
prominently in Driscoll’s outsourc-
ing considerations. “Our technology 
platform in supply chain is not fit 
for the future,” Molin explains. “We 
need to go from an old platform to 
one that is 10 years in front of ev-
eryone else, so we have to make a 
big leap forward within the next 
two years. By selecting the right 
partner, we think that this step-
change will come much faster and 
will be executed smarter.”

Technology not only supports the 
people and process changes that 
must come with the demand transi-
tion but is also intimately related to 
them. “With behavioral and cultural 
changes,” Fowler explains, “data re-
quests become much more mature. 
That can add to the benefits and 
speed up processes by generating 
better insights into demand trends.”

The availability of modern technol-
ogies, such as predictive analytics, 
also liberates personnel who use 
older software, such as spread-
sheets, to figure out customer allo-
cations. “Technology will free them 
up to do greater analytical work 
and add more value to the busi-
ness,” Fowler says. This also means 
that some companies, including 
Driscoll’s, may have to say goodbye 
to employees not able to step up to 
that change.

The COVID-19 pandemic led 
Driscoll’s to discover a serendipi-
tous benefit to the implementation 
of the right technology. Demand 
for produce like raspberries and 
strawberries tanked during the 
early weeks of the virus, as might 
be expected. Driscoll’s couldn’t do 
much about that, but it did figure 

out a way to gain greater visibili-
ty and insight into the availability  
of supply.

“Our inspectors couldn’t go into the 
fields to look at the crops due to 
the infection risk,” Molin explains, 
“so they worked off pictures of the 
crops. We were able to feed those 
pictures into a smart software sys-
tem that built a predictive analyti-
cal capability and provided insight 
into the development of the fruit. 
We became smarter because of the 
availability of that data.”

The same considerations could ap-
ply to any company, especially those 
dealing with fast-moving consumer 
goods. “Data drives better decision 
making,” Fowler says. “It’s cru-
cial that all stakeholders have the 
right information for strategic-lev-
el planning. That is also important 
in moving from transactional en-
counters to a proper relationship  
with customers.

“There will be other events, like 
economic downturns and natural 
disasters, that will impact compa-
nies’ supply chains,” he concludes. 
“But putting the right people, pro-
cesses and technologies in place 
will allow them to react better, for 
their own benefits and for the ben-
efit of their customers.”

For more information, visit 
www.gep.com
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